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Fraud and Abuse in Healthcare Claims 

Fraud and abuse in healthcare claims are widespread in the U.S. healthcare system.  They sap 8-
15% of annual health expenditures.  The FBI has estimated that fraud alone accounts for 3-10% 
of health expenditures.1  Numerous empirical studies have found abuse in claims through 
upcoding, code creep, and the proliferation of codes, exhausting another 5-10% of our annual 
health expenditures.2  International experience has shown that a single-payer system can vastly 
reduce fraud and abuse in claims by leveraging a uniform data system.3  In estimating the cost of 
a unified financing system, the consultants must take the potential savings from reducing fraud 
and abuse into account.    

What is fraud and abuse in healthcare claims?   

Healthcare fraud is a legal term referring to when providers intentionally bill payers for services 
that were not rendered or that were rendered under false pretenses, to no defensible medical 
purpose.  While some frauds involve the forgery of medical records documenting care never 
delivered, others involve kickbacks to providers from health technology or pharmaceutical 
companies for improper prescribing behavior.  For instance, there have been a number of recent 
cases in which telemedicine companies paid compliant physicians to prescribe unnecessary drugs 
to patients through designated pharmacies, which then gave the telemedicine companies 
kickbacks for these prescriptions.  The Department of Justice prosecuted more than $6 billion of 
healthcare fraud in 2020.4 

Abuse in claims comes in a variety of forms.  The most common variety is upcoding, which 
refers to when providers intentionally bill payers for more intensive care than their patient 
genuinely needed.  For example, providers may round an infant’s birthweight down so that their 
neonatal care will be more highly remunerated or round the duration of a cancer patient’s 
chemotherapy infusion up for the same reason.5  Even long-term care hospital discharges cluster 
just past coding thresholds.6  Code creep refers to the ambiguities in defining codes when 
medical services are individual personal services with variation and complicity.  Providers learn 
over time and take advantage of ambiguities in code definitions, coding strategically to gain 
higher payment.  Colleges offer degrees in medical coding, and even physicians often enroll in 
courses to learn how to optimize their coding.7  Under risk-adjusted capitation payment, health 
plans upcode enrollees into higher risk classes to gain higher payments.8  For example, health 
plans may round down a child’s age to garner a higher capitation rate.   

Moreover, providers have successfully pushed for expansions in the number of billing codes to 
increase their revenue.  Since 1987, the 473 DRG codes used for inpatient hospital services have 
proliferated to close 1,000.9  The CPT codes for physician services have proliferated from 
around 3,500 in the 1960s to well over 10,000.10  The proliferation of billing codes has allowed 
providers to receive more compensation for delivery of the same services.  
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How much fraud and abuse is there in the US healthcare system? 

In the prior section, we noted that the FBI has estimated that 3-10% of national healthcare 
expenditures are attributable to fraud.11  Sophisticated kickback arrangements between 
prescribing physicians and pharmacies or laboratories are regularly prosecuted.12  Fraudulent 
claims by nursing homes and home health services frequently capture newspaper headlines.13  
However, the Department of Justice can only identify and prosecute a small fraction of the total 
fraud burden due to resource constraints and the frequent need for whistleblower testimony to 
advance these cases through the legal system.14 

As for upcoding, CMS issues an annual report on “improper payments” by Medicare.  In 2020, 
these amounted to 6-7% of Medicare expenditures.15  However, this could either overestimate or 
underestimate actual upcoding.  It could be an overestimate because payments that lack adequate 
documentation for any reason are classified as improper, or it could be an underestimate because 
upcoding is often accompanied by adequate documentation.16     

There are numerous academic studies of abuses in claim billing. In general, they have identified 
upcoding ranging from 5-15% of expenditures.17  For example, Brunt found that 15.7% of 
Medicare expenditures on “general office visits” may be attributable to upcoding, and Bastani et 
al. found that hospitals routinely misrepresent hospital-acquired infections as present on 
admission in coding so as to maximize their payment.18  However, studies such as these are 
typically limited in scope to a specific program, medical service, or period, making it difficult 
use them to reach a precise estimate of upcoding system-wide.  As for code creep, Cook and 
Averett found that when CMS approved an expansion of DRG codes in 2007, it resulted in a 3% 
increase in Medicare hospital expenditures due to additional upcoding.19   

The new medical billing industry presents indirect evidence of the practice of upcoding.  Medical 
billing companies take over the billing process for providers in exchange for fees totaling as 
much as 10% or more of revenue collected.20  They justify their price with their expertise in 
gaming the coding system.  For instance, they advise providers on how to record clinical 
information so as to justify more lucrative coding.  This memorandum cites over a dozen 
academic sources documenting the extent of upcoding, code creep, and additional expenditures 
attributable to the proliferation of billing codes in the U.S. healthcare system.  

In Medicare Advantage and other risk-adjusted capitation health plans, upcoding to inflate risk 
scores (and associated reimbursement) is well-documented in the scholarly literature.21  For 
example, Geruso and Layton found that this has been responsible for 6-16% increases in the risk 
scores of Medicare Advantage enrollees, costing Medicare $2.4 billion in 2014.22  More 
importantly, the capitation rates for these plans are computed based on expected expenditures in 
the fee-for-service payment system.  Thus, healthcare expenditures attributable to fraud and 
abuse push up capitation rates, allowing Medicare Advantage companies to pull in higher profits. 

In sum, we estimate a plausible lower bound of U.S. healthcare expenditures due to fraud and 
abuse around 8% and an upper bound around 15%, consisting of 3-10% attributable to fraud in 
healthcare claims, combined with 5-10% attributable to upcoding, code creep, the proliferation 
of codes, and risk-adjustment enhancement for capitation rates.     
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How much could a single-payer system reduce fraud and abuse in claims? 

Under a single-payer system, it would create a unified electronic medical record database with 
all clinical and claim data coded uniformly.  Such a comprehensive database would be a 
powerful tool with which to detect fraud and abuse in claims.  First, because the database would 
give a complete profile of each provider’s billed services, it could be used to screen each 
provider’s total claims for reasonableness, picking out potential fraud.  For example, the 
Taiwanese and Canadian national health insurance programs have been able to identify 
physicians billing for more than 100 hours of patient care per week.  Already, we have research 
showing that around 3% of active physicians in the U.S. bill Medicare Part B for more than 100 
hours of work per week; if we could combine that Medicare data with claims submitted to other 
payers, we could identify far more.23  We could also easily detect nursing homes’ claims for care 
in excess of their bed capacity.  To identify potential upcoding and code creep, Taiwan and other 
single-payer nations have developed sophisticated statistical tools, which they apply to their 
unified claims data.  When they pick up outliers, they pass the results of their analysis on to 
medical professional review committees, which—through the use peer pressure and sanctions—
have vastly controlled the extent of upcoding.  In just the first two years after Taiwan 
transitioned to single-payer, this approach allowed its health system to cut total healthcare 
expenditures by 8% through reductions in fraud and abuse.24  Today, advancements in artificial 
intelligence might allow a single-payer system in the U.S. to reduce expenditures by even 
more.25   
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